
AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/22/2019 To 10/22/2019

WA8 18023748 2612 E KINGS AVE Cletus / Rose (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$40,400.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT No response

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$39,137.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Apparent low bidder$38,050.00

SWABS-AZ, INC. Response "no bid" (busy)

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC No response



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/22/2019 To 10/22/2019

EH8 18023829 4710 S 37TH AVE Cletus / Tracy (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$29,904.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Unsuccessful bid$23,515.00

SWABS-AZ, INC. No response

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$25,600.00

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Unsuccessful bid$23,100.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Apparent low bidder$22,675.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/22/2019 To 10/22/2019

EH8 19060898 2201 W PECAN RD Eddie / Rose (<=$25K) Rehab Resdl (C61)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$37,650.00

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Apparent low bidder$34,097.49

SWABS-AZ, INC. Response "no bid" (busy)

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$37,800.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Unsuccessful bid$38,050.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/22/2019 To 10/22/2019

WA8 19060966 1721 S 64TH AVE David / TracyWeatherization

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC No response

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$13,460.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Apparent low bidder$13,455.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/22/2019 To 10/22/2019

EH8 19061018 4721 W HAZELWOOD ST David / Rose (<=$25K) Rehab Resdl (C61)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Unsuccessful bid$22,847.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$25,360.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Apparent low bidder$16,850.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC No response

SWABS-AZ, INC. No response

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Unsuccessful bid$20,550.00

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$25,600.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/22/2019 To 10/22/2019

EH8 19061030 7635 S 41ST PL Cletus / Rose (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Apparent low bidder$33,350.00

SWABS-AZ, INC. Response "no bid" (busy)

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$37,700.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Unsuccessful bid$33,520.00

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$42,060.00


